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The crash of a U.S. reconnaissance plane into the Colombian jungle on February 13, 2003, set off a series of
events that, five years later, would bring three South American countries on a collision course toward war,
pit a giant government contractor against its employer - the U.S. government - and catapult a 40-year-old
guerrilla army to the international stage as one of the most active and successful terrorist organizations in the
world.

Hostage Nation follows the players in this international drama in which lives interweave across a chaotic and
deadly chessboard. While at first the case appeared to be a one-dimensional kidnapping of three American
contractors that would play out in backdoor negotiations, as many had before, the paradigm shift that took
over Washington after 9/11 made impossible any such path to win the freedom of the hostages.

This is the story of Thomas Howes, Keith Stansell, and Marc Gonsalves, three Americans who went to work
for the U.S. government's ill-fought "War on Drugs" and crash-landed into their worst nightmare, five years
in captivity of the FARC rebel Army. It is the story of Colombian presidential candidate Ingrid Betancourt,
poster child for all the prisoners in Colombia. It is the story of corporate malfeasance by Northrop Grumman,
one of the largest defense contractors in America. It is the story of a paradigm shift that turned poor
Colombian guerrillas into the biggest drug mafia in the world and earned them a prominent position on the
U.S. list of terrorist organizations.

This is also a fascinating expose about the way that civilian soldiers have become the main players in covert
wars that fly under the radar of the American people. It is the story of the U.S. government's ambivalence
concerning victims who don't have to be tallied on the nightly news. It is the story of fragmented government
factions that refuse to work together, and of foreign-policy blunders that put government contracts above
American lives. It is the story of lives unraveling, of abandoned women and children, and of feuding
families. And it is a revealing truth about the disastrous failure of the war on drugs that began back in 1970.
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From reader reviews:

Sonya Wright:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Hostage Nation: Colombia's
Guerrilla Army and the Failed War on Drugs book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this
book is more than just a book.

Christina Mundell:

The reason? Because this Hostage Nation: Colombia's Guerrilla Army and the Failed War on Drugs is an
unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will surprise you
with the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your skill and
your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
guide store hurriedly.

Fernando Minaya:

Hostage Nation: Colombia's Guerrilla Army and the Failed War on Drugs can be one of your starter books
that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that will
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information.
The copy writer giving his/her effort to put every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Hostage
Nation: Colombia's Guerrilla Army and the Failed War on Drugs but doesn't forget the main place, giving
the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be considered one of
it. This great information can drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Cynthia Tso:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Hostage Nation: Colombia's Guerrilla
Army and the Failed War on Drugs reserve written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book that could be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
doubt Hostage Nation: Colombia's Guerrilla Army and the Failed War on Drugs as good book not just by the
cover but also by content. This is one reserve that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so



why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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