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Nightmares, confessions, hallucinations, and laudanum-induced fears—Thomas De Quincey’s Confessions
of an English Opium-Eater remains an influential autobiography studied by psychologists, addiction
specialists, historians and sociologists alike. Published in 1821, De Quincey’s debut work on his own
addiction and the effects of drugs on creativity set a unique tone for modern literature.

Revealing the power of the subconscious and freedom of artistic self-expression, De Quincey shares the
pleasures of opium, along with the struggles of addiction and the ability of the human imagination.
Confessions of an English Opium-Eater’s overwhelming success influenced writers such as Charles
Baudelaire, Edgar Allan Poe and William S. Burroughs.

HarperTorch brings great works of non-fiction and the dramatic arts to life in digital format, upholding the
highest standards in ebook production and celebrating reading in all its forms. Look for more titles in the
HarperTorch collection to build your digital library.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Furman:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone at everywhere. The
information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be consider whenever
those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen inside you if you take Confessions Of An English Opium-Eater as the daily resource information.

Jose Gould:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Confessions Of An English Opium-
Eater can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications
have than the others?

Brianna Bell:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Confessions Of An English Opium-Eater was bright
colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Confessions Of An English
Opium-Eater has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigator
Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally
make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you
personally and try to like reading this.

Sandra Lynn:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update of
news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual.
From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story
and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just trying to find the Confessions Of An English Opium-Eater when you desired it?
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