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We have come to admire Buddhism for being profound but accessible, as much a lifestyle as a religion. The
credit for creating Buddhism goes to the Buddha, a figure widely respected across the Western world for his
philosophical insight, his teachings of nonviolence, and his practice of meditation. But who was this Buddha,
and how did he become the Buddha we know and love today?

 

Leading historian of Buddhism Donald S. Lopez Jr. tells the story of how various idols carved in
stone—variously named Beddou, Codam, Xaca, and Fo—became the man of flesh and blood that we know
simply as the Buddha. He reveals that the positive view of the Buddha in Europe and America is rather
recent, originating a little more than a hundred and fifty years ago. For centuries, the Buddha was
condemned by Western writers as the most dangerous idol of the Orient. He was a demon, the murderer of
his mother, a purveyor of idolatry.

 

Lopez provides an engaging history of depictions of the Buddha from classical accounts and medieval stories
to the testimonies of European travelers, diplomats, soldiers, and missionaries. He shows that centuries of
hostility toward the Buddha changed dramatically in the nineteenth century, when the teachings of the
Buddha, having disappeared from India by the fourteenth century, were read by European scholars newly
proficient in Asian languages. At the same time, the traditional view of the Buddha persisted in Asia, where
he was revered as much for his supernatural powers as for his philosophical insights. From Stone to Flesh
follows the twists and turns of these Eastern and Western notions of the Buddha, leading finally to his
triumph as the founder of a world religion.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Thompson:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled From Stone to
Flesh: A Short History of the Buddha (Buddhism and Modernity)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you.
You realize beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do
you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Allen Mullinax:

The e-book untitled From Stone to Flesh: A Short History of the Buddha (Buddhism and Modernity) is the
book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy
writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, hence the information that they share to you
personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of From Stone to Flesh: A Short History of
the Buddha (Buddhism and Modernity) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Willie Letchworth:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic in
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the book untitled From Stone to Flesh: A Short History of the Buddha (Buddhism
and Modernity) can be good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Veda Howard:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that.
What you need to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. On
the list of books in the top list in your reading list is definitely From Stone to Flesh: A Short History of the
Buddha (Buddhism and Modernity). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you
closer in turning into precious person. By looking way up and review this book you can get many
advantages.
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